



SUMMARY

STATE OF MICHIGAN OIL AND GAS LEASE AUCTION

May 7, 2018

**Department of Natural Resources
Office of Minerals Management**

State of Michigan Oil and Gas Lease Auction May 7, 2018

Bidder Number	Lessee	Total Acres	Total Bonus + Total Rental
101	Michael W. Flynn P.O. Box 2104 Traverse City, MI 49686	No Bid	No Bid
102	Savoy Energy, L.P., registered to transact business in Michigan as Savoy Energy Limited Partnership P.O. Box 1560 Traverse City, MI 49685	1,051.00	\$15,289.00
103	West Bay Exploration Company 13685 South West Bay Shore Traverse City, MI 49684	2,730.15	\$226,253.10
104	Gallatin Energy, Inc. P.O. Box 1122 Gaylord, MI 49734	160.00	\$2,240.00
105	Berea Oil & Gas, LLC P.O. Box 301 Jackson, MI 49204	115.42	\$1,970.84
106	Western Land Services, Inc. 1100 Conrad Industrial Drive Ludington, MI 49431	40.00	\$800.00
107	CORE Energy, LLC 1011 Noteware Drive Traverse City, MI 49686	240.00	\$4,800.00
108	Maritz Land Company LLC P.O. Box 4126 Traverse City, MI 49685	40.00	\$800.00
109	Mathew Maritz P.O. Box 4126 Traverse City, MI 49685	No Bid	No Bid
Totals:		4,376.57	\$252,152.94

Mineral Auction Stipulation Report

Stipulation ID	Stipulation Name	Description
8	Including Riparian Rights	Including riparian rights adjacent thereto.
15	Limited Surface Disturbance-OG FEE	To limit surface disturbance, any wells to be drilled on the leased premises shall be drilled from a single surface area that is acceptable to and approved by the Lessor. The Lessee shall submit a proposed development plan for the leased premises including a proposed surface area, access routes and pipeline corridors, with due regard to surface features, the relative location of other operations in the area, and applicable regulatory requirements. The Lessee may not drill any well on the leased premises without first obtaining an approval from the Lessor. Approval shall not be unreasonably withheld. If Lessor reasonably determines that production on adjacent land creates the probability of drainage of oil and/or gas from State mineral land, additional surface locations may be considered.
19	Recreational Trails	All other provisions of this lease notwithstanding, it is understood that no well site shall be located closer than 660 feet to any recreational trail without obtaining the written consent of the Lessor and contacting the local Department trails coordinator.
20	Use Existing Well Pad	All other provisions of this lease notwithstanding, it is further understood that existing well pads shall be used for drilling unless otherwise authorized by the Department of Natural Resources' Land Manager.
49	Best Management Practices	Best Management Practices along wetlands, waterways, or steep slopes as per Sustainable Soil and Water Practices on Forest Land IC 4011 (Rev. 02/24/2009 and as amended) and approved in writing by the Local Management Supervisor.
68	Potential for Restricted Activity	An environmental review has indicated the potential for restricted activity on this parcel. All other provisions of this lease notwithstanding, it is understood that no exploration or development work shall be conducted on this parcel without first contacting the local Michigan Department of Environmental Quality District Office to obtain specific special instructions regarding use of the surface.

Mineral Lease Auction Results

Oil And Gas Lease Auction Monday May 7, 2018

Offering Number	Description	Section	Lease Acres	Equity	Bid Acres	Bidder Number	Per Acre Bid	Total Bid	Lease Number
Arenac County T19N R03E									
1					160		\$0.00		No Bid
8 15	NE1/4 of the SE1/4 Subject to existing easements.	9	40.00	Min 100% Sur 100%					
15	NW1/4 of the SE1/4	9	40.00	Min 100% Sur 100%					
15	SE1/4 of the SE1/4 Subject to existing easements.	9	40.00	Min 100% Sur 100%					
15	SW1/4 of the SE1/4	9	40.00	Min 100% Sur 100%					
2					80		\$0.00		No Bid
15	NE1/4 SE1/4 Subject to existing easements.	16	40.00	Min 100% Sur 100%					
15	SE1/4 SE1/4	16	40.00	Min 100% Sur 100%					

* = Attorney Title Opinion Required. See Oil and Gas Lease Auction Guidelines.

Mineral Lease Auction Results

Oil And Gas Lease Auction Monday May 7, 2018

Offering Number	Description	Section	Lease Acres	Equity	Bid Acres	Bidder Number	Per Acre Bid	Total Bid	Lease Number
Clare County T20N R03W									
3					42	103	\$10.00	\$420.00	59632
15 49	E1/2 of the NE1/4 [fractional Section 5] EXCEPT the W 1/4 lying North of the centerline of Angle Road Subject to existing easements.	5	41.96	Min 100% Sur 100%					
4					155	103	\$10.00	\$1,550.00	59633
15 49	NE1/4 SE1/4 Subject to existing easements.	5	40.00	Min 100% Sur 100%					
15 49	NW1/4 of the SE1/4 EXCEPT all that part lying North of the centerline of Angle Road Subject to existing easements.	5	34.50	Min 100% Sur 100%					
15 49	SE1/4 SE1/4	5	40.00	Min 100% Sur 100%					
49	SW1/4 SE1/4	5	40.00	Min 100% Sur 0%					
5					56	103	\$10.00	\$560.00	59634
49	W1/2 NE1/4	6	55.25	Min 100% Sur 0%					
6					55	103	\$10.00	\$550.00	59635
15 49	East Half of Northwest Quarter (E1/2 NW1/4)	6	54.99	Min 100% Sur 100%					
7					120	103	\$10.00	\$1,200.00	59636
15 49	NE1/4 NE1/4	8	40.00	Min 100% Sur 100%					
15 49	NW1/4 NE1/4	8	40.00	Min 100% Sur 100%					
15 49	SW1/4 NE1/4	8	40.00	Min 100% Sur 100%					
8					115	103	\$10.00	\$1,150.00	59637
15 49	NE1/4 NW1/4	8	40.00	Min 100% Sur 100%					

* = Attorney Title Opinion Required. See Oil and Gas Lease Auction Guidelines.

Mineral Lease Auction Results

Oil And Gas Lease Auction Monday May 7, 2018

Offering Number	Description	Section	Lease Acres	Equity	Bid Acres	Bidder Number	Per Acre Bid	Total Bid	Lease Number
Clare County									
T20N R03W									
8	[Continued]				115	103	\$10.00	\$1,150.00	59637
15 49	NW1/4 NW1/4 except N1/2 NW1/4 NW1/4 NW1/4	8	35.00	Min 100% Sur 100%					
15 49	SW1/4 NW1/4	8	40.00	Min 100% Sur 100%					
9					80	103	\$10.00	\$800.00	59638
15 49	NW1/4 SE1/4	8	40.00	Min 100% Sur 100%					
15 49	SW1/4 SE1/4	8	40.00	Min 100% Sur 100%					
10					80	103	\$10.00	\$800.00	59639
15 49	NW1/4 SW1/4	8	40.00	Min 100% Sur 100%					
15 49	SW1/4 SW1/4	8	40.00	Min 100% Sur 100%					
11					160	103	\$135.00	\$21,600.00	59640
15 49	NE1/4 SE1/4	14	40.00	Min 100% Sur 100%					
15 49	NW1/4 SE1/4	14	40.00	Min 100% Sur 100%					
15 49	SE1/4 SE1/4	14	40.00	Min 100% Sur 100%					
15 49	SW1/4 SE1/4	14	40.00	Min 100% Sur 100%					
12					80	103	\$10.00	\$800.00	59641
15 49	NW1/4 NE1/4	17	40.00	Min 100% Sur 100%					
15 49	SW1/4 NE1/4	17	40.00	Min 100% Sur 100%					
N-13					40	103	\$10.00	\$400.00	N-59642
	SE1/4 NE1/4	17	40.00	Min 100% Sur 100%					

* = Attorney Title Opinion Required. See Oil and Gas Lease Auction Guidelines.

Mineral Lease Auction Results

Oil And Gas Lease Auction Monday May 7, 2018

Offering Number	Description	Section	Lease Acres	Equity	Bid Acres	Bidder Number	Per Acre Bid	Total Bid	Lease Number
Clare County T20N R03W									
N- 14	NE1/4 NW1/4	17	40.00	Min 100% Sur 0%	80	103	\$10.00	\$800.00	N-59643
	SE1/4 NW1/4	17	40.00	Min 100% Sur 0%					
15	NE1/4 SW1/4	17	40.00	Min 100% Sur 0%	40	103	\$10.00	\$400.00	59644
16	NE1/4 NE1/4 easements. Subject to existing	18	40.00	Min 100% Sur 100%	160	103	\$10.00	\$1,600.00	59645
15 49	NW1/4 NE1/4	18	40.00	Min 100% Sur 100%					
15 49	SE1/4 NE1/4 easements. Subject to existing	18	40.00	Min 100% Sur 100%					
15 49	SW1/4 NE1/4	18	40.00	Min 100% Sur 100%					
17	NE1/4 NW1/4 easements. Subject to existing	18	40.00	Min 100% Sur 100%	169	103	\$10.00	\$1,690.00	59646
15 49	NW1/4 NW1/4 easements. Subject to existing	18	44.35	Min 100% Sur 100%					
15 49	SE1/4 NW1/4 easements. Subject to existing	18	40.00	Min 100% Sur 100%					
15 49	SW1/4 NW1/4 easements. Subject to existing	18	43.76	Min 100% Sur 100%					

* = Attorney Title Opinion Required. See Oil and Gas Lease Auction Guidelines.

Mineral Lease Auction Results

Oil And Gas Lease Auction Monday May 7, 2018

Offering Number	Description	Section	Lease Acres	Equity	Bid Acres	Bidder Number	Per Acre Bid	Total Bid	Lease Number
Clare County									
T20N R03W									
18					160	103	\$10.00	\$1,600.00	59647
15 49	NE1/4 SE1/4 easements. Subject to existing	18	40.00	Min 100% Sur 100%					
15 49	NW1/4 SE1/4	18	40.00	Min 100% Sur 100%					
15 49	SE1/4 SE1/4 easements. Subject to existing	18	40.00	Min 100% Sur 100%					
15 49	SW1/4 SE1/4	18	40.00	Min 100% Sur 100%					
19					80	103	\$10.00	\$800.00	59648
15 49	NE1/4 SW1/4	18	40.00	Min 100% Sur 100%					
15 49	SE1/4 SW1/4	18	40.00	Min 100% Sur 100%					
N- 20					1	103	\$10.00	\$10.00	N-59649
	*Com at a pt 333 ft S & 450 ft W of NE Sec cor th N 150 ft th W 100 ft th S 150 ft th E 100 ft to pob	25	0.34	Min 100% Sur 0%					
21					40	103	\$10.00	\$400.00	59650
49	NW1/4 SE1/4	28	40.00	Min 100% Sur 0%					
22					80	103	\$10.00	\$800.00	59651
15 49	NE1/4 NE1/4 easements. Subject to existing	30	40.00	Min 100% Sur 100%					
15 49	SE1/4 NE1/4 easements. Subject to existing	30	40.00	Min 100% Sur 100%					
23					80	103	\$10.00	\$800.00	59652
15 49	SE1/4 NE1/4 easements. Subject to existing	33	40.00	Min 100% Sur 100%					

* = Attorney Title Opinion Required. See Oil and Gas Lease Auction Guidelines.

Mineral Lease Auction Results

Oil And Gas Lease Auction Monday May 7, 2018

Offering Number	Description	Section	Lease Acres	Equity	Bid Acres	Bidder Number	Per Acre Bid	Total Bid	Lease Number
	Clare County T20N R03W								
23	(Continued)				80	103	\$10.00	\$800.00	59652
15 49	SW1/4 NE1/4	33	40.00	Min 100% Sur 100%					

* = Attorney Title Opinion Required. See Oil and Gas Lease Auction Guidelines.

Mineral Lease Auction Results

Oil And Gas Lease Auction Monday May 7, 2018

Offering Number	Description	Section	Lease Acres	Equity	Bid Acres	Bidder Number	Per Acre Bid	Total Bid	Lease Number
Gladwin County T17N R02W									
24					80	104	\$12.00	\$960.00	59653
49	NE1/4 SW1/4	4	40.00	Min 100% Sur 0%					
49	NW1/4 SW1/4	4	40.00	Min 100% Sur 0%					
N-25					80	104	\$12.00	\$960.00	N-59654
	SE1/4 SW1/4	4	40.00	Min 100% Sur 0%					
	SW1/4 SW1/4	4	40.00	Min 100% Sur 0%					
26					80	102	\$25.00	\$2,000.00	59655
49	NW1/4 SE1/4	21	40.00	Min 100% Sur 0%					
49	SW1/4 SE1/4	21	40.00	Min 100% Sur 0%					
N-27					40	102	\$16.00	\$640.00	N-59656
	NE1/4 NW1/4	28	40.00	Min 100% Sur 0%					
N-28					80	102	\$15.00	\$1,200.00	N-59657
	NW1/4 NE1/4	29	40.00	Min 100% Sur 0%					
	SW1/4 NE1/4	29	40.00	Min 100% Sur 0%					
29					80	107	\$10.00	\$800.00	59658
49	NE1/4 SE1/4	29	40.00	Min 100% Sur 0%					
49	NW1/4 SE1/4	29	40.00	Min 100% Sur 0%					

* = Attorney Title Opinion Required. See Oil and Gas Lease Auction Guidelines.

Mineral Lease Auction Results

Oil And Gas Lease Auction Monday May 7, 2018

Offering Number	Description	Section	Lease Acres	Equity	Bid Acres	Bidder Number	Per Acre Bid	Total Bid	Lease Number
Grand Traverse County									
T27N R10W									
30					40	108	\$10.00	\$400.00	59659
19 49	Part of SE1/4 SW1/4 com at NW cor of sd 1/4 sec. N 89d41'46" E alg S 1/8 ln 331.29 ft, S 45d14'40" W 531.58 ft to W 1/8 ln, N alg W 1/8 ln 347 ft to pob.	24	1.78	Min 100% Sur 0%					
19 49	SE1/4 SW1/4 exc. com at NW cor of sd 1/4 1/4 sec N 89d41'46" E alg S 1/8 ln 331.29 ft, S 45d14'40" W 531.58 ft to W 1/8 ln, N alg W 1/8 ln 347 ft to pob.	24	38.22	Min 100% Sur 100%					

* = Attorney Title Opinion Required. See Oil and Gas Lease Auction Guidelines.

Mineral Lease Auction Results

Oil And Gas Lease Auction Monday May 7, 2018

Offering Number	Description	Section	Lease Acres	Equity	Bid Acres	Bidder Number	Per Acre Bid	Total Bid	Lease Number
	Isabella County T15N R03W								
N-31	SE 1/4 of SW 1/4	27	40.00	Min 100% Sur 0%	40	106	\$10.00	\$400.00	N-59660

* = Attorney Title Opinion Required. See Oil and Gas Lease Auction Guidelines.

Mineral Lease Auction Results

Oil And Gas Lease Auction Monday May 7, 2018

Offering Number	Description	Section	Lease Acres	Equity	Bid Acres	Bidder Number	Per Acre Bid	Total Bid	Lease Number
Kalamazoo County									
T04S R09W									
N- 32	NE1/4 NE1/4 easements. Subject to existing	23	40.00	Min 100% Sur 100%	80	102	\$10.00	\$800.00	N-59661
	SE1/4 NE1/4 easements. Subject to existing	23	40.00	Min 100% Sur 100%					
N- 33	NE1/4 SE1/4	23	40.00	Min 100% Sur 100%	92	102	\$10.00	\$920.00	N-59662
	That part of S1/2 SE1/4 lying W of Bear Creek	23	52.00	Min 100% Sur 100%					
N- 34	NE1/4 NE1/4	26	40.00	Min 100% Sur 100%	160	102	\$10.00	\$1,600.00	N-59663
	NW1/4 NE1/4	26	40.00	Min 100% Sur 100%					
	SE1/4 NE1/4	26	40.00	Min 100% Sur 100%					
	SW1/4 NE1/4	26	40.00	Min 100% Sur 100%					
N- 35	NE1/4 SE1/4	26	40.00	Min 100% Sur 100%	160	102	\$10.00	\$1,600.00	N-59664
	NW1/4 SE1/4	26	40.00	Min 100% Sur 100%					
	SE1/4 SE1/4 easements. Subject to existing	26	40.00	Min 100% Sur 100%					
	SW1/4 SE1/4 easements. Subject to existing	26	40.00	Min 100% Sur 100%					

* = Attorney Title Opinion Required. See Oil and Gas Lease Auction Guidelines.

Mineral Lease Auction Results

Oil And Gas Lease Auction Monday May 7, 2018

Offering Number	Description	Section	Lease Acres	Equity	Bid Acres	Bidder Number	Per Acre Bid	Total Bid	Lease Number	
Kalamazoo County										
T04S R09W										
N-36	NE1/4 SW1/4	26	40.00	Min 100% Sur 100%	160	102	\$10.00	\$1,600.00	N-59665	
	NW1/4 SW1/4	26	40.00	Min 100% Sur 100%						
	SE1/4 SW1/4 easements.	26	40.00	Min 100% Sur 100%						Subject to existing
	SW1/4 SW1/4 easements.	26	40.00	Min 100% Sur 100%						Subject to existing

* = Attorney Title Opinion Required. See Oil and Gas Lease Auction Guidelines.

Mineral Lease Auction Results

Oil And Gas Lease Auction Monday May 7, 2018

Offering Number	Description	Section	Lease Acres	Equity	Bid Acres	Bidder Number	Per Acre Bid	Total Bid	Lease Number
	Kalkaska County T27N R07W								
N- 37	E1/2 NE1/4 NE1/4	19	20.00	Min 100% Sur 0%	79	102	\$13.00	\$1,027.00	N-59666
	W1/2 NE1/4 NE1/4	19	20.00	Min 100% Sur 0%					
	West part NW1/4 NE1/4	19	39.00	Min 100% Sur 0%					

* = Attorney Title Opinion Required. See Oil and Gas Lease Auction Guidelines.

Mineral Lease Auction Results

Oil And Gas Lease Auction Monday May 7, 2018

Offering Number	Description	Section	Lease Acres	Equity	Bid Acres	Bidder Number	Per Acre Bid	Total Bid	Lease Number
Midland County T15N R02W									
38					80	103	\$10.00	\$800.00	59667
15 49	NE1/4 NW1/4	34	40.00	Min 100% Sur 100%					
15 49	SW1/4 NW1/4	34	40.00	Min 100% Sur 100%					
39					60	103	\$10.00	\$600.00	59668
15 49	NW1/4 NE1/4	35	40.00	Min 100% Sur 100%					
15 49	S1/2 NE1/4 NE1/4 existing easements.	35	20.00	Min 100% Sur 100%					Subject to
40					80	103	\$10.00	\$800.00	59669
15 49	NE1/4 NW1/4	35	40.00	Min 100% Sur 100%					
15 49	NW1/4 NW1/4	35	40.00	Min 100% Sur 100%					
41					40	103	\$10.00	\$400.00	59670
15 49	SW1/4 SW1/4	35	40.00	Min 100% Sur 100%					

* = Attorney Title Opinion Required. See Oil and Gas Lease Auction Guidelines.

Mineral Lease Auction Results

Oil And Gas Lease Auction Monday May 7, 2018

Offering Number	Description	Section	Lease Acres	Equity	Bid Acres	Bidder Number	Per Acre Bid	Total Bid	Lease Number
Presque Isle County T33N R02E									
42					80	107	\$10.00	\$800.00	59671
49 68	SE1/4 SE1/4	9	40.00	Min 100% Sur 100%					
49 68	SW1/4 SE1/4	9	40.00	Min 100% Sur 100%					
N-43					80	107	\$10.00	\$800.00	N-59672
	NE1/4 SE1/4	9	40.00	Min 100% Sur 100%					
	NW1/4 SE1/4	9	40.00	Min 100% Sur 100%					
44					120	102	\$15.00	\$1,800.00	59673
	NE1/4 NW1/4	16	40.00	Min 100% Sur 100%					
49	NW1/4 NW1/4	16	40.00	Min 100% Sur 100%					
	SW1/4 NW1/4	16	40.00	Min 100% Sur 100%					
N-45					116	105	\$15.00	\$1,740.00	N-59674
	NE1/4 SW1/4	18	40.00	Min 100% Sur 100%					
	NW1/4 SW1/4	18	35.42	Min 100% Sur 100%					
	SE1/4 SW1/4	18	40.00	Min 100% Sur 100%					

* = Attorney Title Opinion Required. See Oil and Gas Lease Auction Guidelines.

Mineral Lease Auction Results

Oil And Gas Lease Auction Monday May 7, 2018

Offering Number	Description	Section	Lease Acres	Equity	Bid Acres	Bidder Number	Per Acre Bid	Total Bid	Lease Number
Roscommon County									
T21N R03W									
46					120	103	\$260.00	\$31,200.00	59675
15 19 49	NE1/4 NE1/4 easements. Subject to existing	33	40.00	Min 100% Sur 100%					
15 19 20 49	NW1/4 NE1/4 easements. Subject to existing	33	40.00	Min 100% Sur 100%					
15 20 49 68	SW1/4 NE1/4 easements. Subject to existing	33	40.00	Min 100% Sur 100%					
47					160	103	\$240.00	\$38,400.00	59676
15 20 49	NE1/4 SE1/4 easements. Subject to existing	33	40.00	Min 100% Sur 100%					
15	NW1/4 SE1/4 easements. Subject to existing	33	40.00	Min 100% Sur 100%					
15 49	SE1/4 SE1/4 easements. Subject to existing	33	40.00	Min 100% Sur 100%					
	SW1/4 SE1/4 easements. Subject to existing	33	40.00	Min 100% Sur 100%					
48					160	103	\$370.00	\$59,200.00	59677
19 49	NE1/4 SE1/4 easements. Subject to existing	34	40.00	Min 100% Sur 100%					
19 49	NW1/4 SE1/4 easements. Subject to existing	34	40.00	Min 100% Sur 100%					
19 49	SE1/4 SE1/4 easements. Subject to existing	34	40.00	Min 100% Sur 100%					

* = Attorney Title Opinion Required. See Oil and Gas Lease Auction Guidelines.

Mineral Lease Auction Results

Oil And Gas Lease Auction Monday May 7, 2018

Offering Number	Description	Section	Lease Acres	Equity	Bid Acres	Bidder Number	Per Acre Bid	Total Bid	Lease Number
Roscommon County									
T21N R03W									
48	[Continued]								
19 49	SW1/4 SE1/4 easements. Subject to existing	34	40.00	Min 100% Sur 100%	160	103	\$370.00	\$59,200.00	59677
49									
19 20	NE1/4 SW1/4 easements. Subject to existing	34	40.00	Min 100% Sur 100%	160	103	\$210.00	\$33,600.00	59678
15 20 49	NW1/4 SW1/4 easements. Subject to existing	34	40.00	Min 100% Sur 100%					
	SE1/4 SW1/4 easements. Subject to existing	34	40.00	Min 100% Sur 100%					
15 49	SW1/4 SW1/4 easements. Subject to existing	34	40.00	Min 100% Sur 100%					

* = Attorney Title Opinion Required. See Oil and Gas Lease Auction Guidelines.

MICHIGAN DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES MISSION STATEMENT

"The Michigan Department of Natural Resources is committed to the conservation, protection, management, use and enjoyment of the State's natural and cultural resources for current and future generations."

NATURAL RESOURCES COMMISSION STATEMENT

The Natural Resources Commission, as the governing body for the Michigan Department of Natural Resources, provides a strategic framework for the DNR to effectively manage your resources. The NRC holds monthly, public meetings throughout Michigan, working closely with its constituencies in establishing and improving natural resources management policy.

The Michigan Department of Natural Resources provides equal opportunities for employment and access to Michigan's natural resources. Both State and Federal laws prohibit discrimination on the basis of race, color, national origin, religion, disability, age, sex, height, weight or marital status under the U.S. Civil Rights Acts of 1964 as amended, 1976 MI PA 453, 1976 MI PA 220, Title V of the Rehabilitation Act of 1973 as amended, and the 1990 Americans with Disabilities Act, as amended.

If you believe that you have been discriminated against in any program, activity, or facility, or if you desire additional information, please write: Human Resources, Michigan Department of Natural Resources, PO Box 30028, Lansing MI 48909-7528, or Michigan Department of Civil Rights, Cadillac Place, 3054 West Grand Blvd, Suite 3-600, Detroit, MI 48202, or Division of Federal Assistance, U.S. Fish and Wildlife Service, 4401 North Fairfax Drive, Mail Stop MBSP-4020, Arlington, VA 22203

For information or assistance on this publication, contact Kimberly Venne, Office of Minerals Management, Michigan Department of Natural Resources, P.O. Box 30452, Lansing, MI 48909.

This publication is available in alternative formats upon request.

Printed by Authority of: **The Michigan Department of Natural Resources**